	broward county rate	nic serioois			
ITB #	#: <u>19-054N</u>	Tentative Board Meetir	ng Date*: AU	JGUST 7, 2018	
ITB 7	Title: ART EQUIPMENT	# Notified:	355	# Downloaded:	19
		# of Responses Rec'd:	3	# of "No Bids":	1
For:	VARIOUS SCHOOLS/DEPARTMENTS	ITB Opening Date :	JULY 5, 201	8	
Fund	(School/Department) I: VARIOUS FUNDS	Advertised Date:	JUNE 12, 20	018	
affected decision ailure formal which the Procure an inter County 3320, P	by the decision or intended decision shall file a notice of protein. The formal written protest shall be filed within ten (10) day to file a formal written protest shall constitute a waiver of processive protest shall state with particularity the facts and law up the District is closed shall be excluded in the computation of ement & Warehousing Services, 7720 West Oakland Park Boulended decision shall post with the School Board, at the time of a Florida, (SBBC), in an amount equal to one percent (1%) of the Part VIII, Purchasing Policies, Section N, within the time allow the Cone of Silence, as stated in the ITB / RFP / RFQ / H.	est, in writing, within 72 hours after the ys after the date the notice of protest seedings under this chapter. Section 1 poon which the protest is based." Satur the 72-hour time period provided. Fi evard, Suite 323, Sunrise, Florida 333 filling the formal written protest, a bout estimated value of the contract. Failed for filling a bond shall constitute a	the posting of the tris filed. Failud 20.57(3)(b), For days, Sundays stillings shall be 351. Any persound, payable to lure to post the waiver of the triangle of the stilling stillings and the stillings are stillings.	e notice of decision or interest of file a notice of prolorida Statutes, states the state holidays and days at the office of the Dirn who files an action promotes at the office of the School Board of Education of	ntended rotest or nat "The s during ector of otesting Broward C Policy
	stated above is tentative. Confirm with the Purchasing A				
	RECOMMEN	DATION TABULATION			
	HALL BE AWARDED BY ITEM OR BY GROUP , TO THE FICATIONS, TERMS AND CONDITIONS.	LOWEST RESPONSIVE AND RES	SPONSIBLE E	BIDDER(S) MEETING	ALL
#	DESCRIPTION	VENDOR(S) A	WARDED		
2.	TABLE, ART	SCHOOL SPEC	IALTY, INC.		
1.	BIN, CLAY WITH WEDGING BOARD	SCHOOL SPEC	IALTY, INC.		
5.	CUTTER, MAT	SCHOOL SPEC	IALTY, INC.		
5.	CUTTER, PAPER AND BOARD ROTARY	SCHOOL SPEC	IALTY, INC.		
7.	RACK, DRYING	SCHOOL SPEC	IALTY, INC.		
3.	WHEEL, ELETRIC POTTER'S WITH STOOL & SPLASH	HPAN SCHOOL SPEC	IALTY, INC.		
9.	CABINETS, DAMP-PROOF & DRYING	DGS EDUCATION	ONAL PRODI	UCTS, INC.	
10.	CABINET, STORAGE	SCHOOL SPEC		,	
	LTERNATE BRANDS OFFERED WERE REVIEWED TO E				
	RECOMMENDED THAT FOR REASON(S) STATED ON TED FOR PARTICULAR ITEMS FOR NOT COMPLYING		ON SHEET, T	THE BIDS REFEREN	CED BE
T IS O	OUR INTENT TO REBID THESE ITEMS AT A LATER DAT	E WITH REVISED SPECIFICATION	ONS.		
CONTI	RACT PERIOD: SEPTEMBER 1, 2018 THROUGH SEPTEM	IBER 30, 2021.			
By:	Karlene Grant	Da	ate:	JULY 23, 2018	

The School Board of Broward County, Florida, prohibits any policy or procedure which results in discrimination on the basis of age, color, disability, gender expression, national origin, marital status, race, religion, sex or sexual orientation. Individuals who wish to file a discrimination complaint, may call the Executive Director, Benefits & EEO Compliance at 754-321-2150 or Teletype Machine (TTY) at 754-321-2158.

(Purchasing Agent)

Individuals with disabilities requesting accommodations under the Americans with Disabilities Act (ADA) may call the Equal Educational Opportunities (EEO) at 754-321-2150 or Teletype Machine (TTY) at 754-321-2158.

19-054N BID REJECTIONS

1. REJECT ITEM#1 FROM SCHOOL SPECIALTY, INC.

BIDS SUBMITTED FOR ITEM 1 COULD NOT BE EVALUATED BASED ON INCORRECT MODEL NUMBERS LISTED IN THE BID'S SPECIFICATIONS.

AS STATED IN SPECIAL CONDITION 3:

INCORRECT/INCOMPLETE SPECIFICATIONS SHOULD BE EMAILED TO THE PURCHASING AGENT WITHIN THE TIMELINE STATED IN THE ITB FOR QUESTIONS, IN ORDER TO UPDATE THE ITB PRIOR TO BID OPENING. IN THE EVENT THAT ANY ITEM IN THE GROUP DOES NOT MEET THE SPECIFICATIONS, THE ENTIRE GROUP SHALL BE DISQUALIFIED.

IT IS OUR INTENT TO REBID THIS ITEM AT A LATER DATE.

2. REJECT ITEM#3 FROM SCHOOL SPECIALTY, INC.

PRICES WERE NOT PROVIDED FOR ALL ITEMS WITHIN THE GROUP.

AS STATED IN SPECIAL CONDITION 3:

FOR ITEMS IN GROUPS, IT IS NECESSARY TO BID ON EVERY ITEM IN THE GROUP, AND ALL ITEMS IN THE GROUP MUST MEET SPECIFICATIONS IN ORDER TO BE CONSIDERED FOR AWARD. IN THE EVENT THAT ANY ITEM IN THE GROUP DOES NOT MEET THE SPECIFICATIONS, THE ENTIRE GROUP SHALL BE DISQUALIFIED.

IT IS OUR INTENT TO REBID THIS ITEM AT A LATER DATE.



ITEM 1 - LINE ITEMS

					Blick Art	Supplies	DGS Educa	tional	School Specialty I	nc.
Item#	Award	Description	U/M	Qty	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price2	Total3	Unit Price4	Total5
	Туре					-				
1	Group	SINK, UNIT								
			ach	2		No Bid		No Bid	1,746.48	3,492.96
		SAP #6001268								
		Hardwood cabinet 35" to 36" wide x 29" to 30" deep with double doors. Inside dimensions are 28" deep x 34" wide. Unit contains a double basin stainless steel sink 21" x 32" overall with water faucets and gooseneck nozzle (no spray hose). Sink has strainers and clay interceptor trap for easy clean out. 28" high gooseneck. (For elementary schools).								
		Approved Brands: Shain Solutions Model SU- 3525 (28H) 060909, Brodhead-Garrett Model CC132S No. 463065 (modified 28"H gooseneck), or other brands meeting bid specifications.								
		Brand Offered:							DIVERSIFIED WOODCRAFTS	
		Model Offered:							3303K (ALTERNATE)	
		Delivery Days (ARO):							30 - 45	
		Warranty Period:							LIMITED LIFETIME WARRANTY	
	1B	SINK UNIT-36" HIGH	ach	2		No Bid	-	No Bid	1,746.48	3,492.96
		SAP #6001269								
		Hardwood cabinet 35" to 36" wide x 29" to 30" deep with double doors. Inside dimensions are 28" deep x 34" wide. Unit contains a double basin stainless steel sink 21" x 32" overall with water faucets and gooseneck nozzle (no spray hose). Sink has strainers and clay interceptor trap for easy clean out. 36" high gooseneck. (For middle and high schools).								
		Approved Brands: Shain Solutions Model SU- 3528 (36H) 060909, Brodhead-Garrett Model CC132S No. 463065 (modified 36"H gooseneck), or other brands meeting bid specifications.								
		Brand Offered:							DIVERSIFIED WOODCRAFTS	
		Model Offered:							3303K (ALTERNATE)	
		Delivery Days (ARO):							30 - 45	
		Warranty Period:							LIMITED LIFETIME WARRANTY	
		TOTAL GROUP 1 (A - B Inclusive)								Not Evalauted



					Blick Art Suppl	ies	DGS Educational		School Specialty Inc.	
Item#	Award Type	Description	U/M	Qty	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total
2		TABLE, ART								
		Unit consists of plastic laminate top, butcher block or wood grain design. Top is 1-1/4" thick. Laminate is 1/16" thick and the core is a 1-1/8" 45 pound density particleboard. See Bid Specifications for additional details. Note: To be shipped unassembled and then assembled by Awardee at school classroom location as per Special Condition 12.								
	0.1			10		No Bid	705.00	7.050.00		
	2A	,	Each	10		INO BIO	795.00	7,950.00	592.64	5,926.40
		SAP #6000437								
		Approved Brands: Shain Solutions Model PT- 62PNB26 or other brands meeting bid specifications.								
		Brand Offered:					HANN (ALTERNATE)		DIVERSIFIED WOODCRAFTS	
		Model Offered:					A2-4260PL3-26-RC-MOD		PT-62PNB26	
		Includes assembly and installation: State Yes or No					YES		YES	
		Delivery Days (ARO):					30 - 45		30 - 45	
		Warranty Period:					MFG STANDARD		LIMITED LIFETIME WARRANTY	
	2B	TABLE, ART - MIDDLE SCHOOL - 42"W x 60"L x 30"H	Each	10		No Bid	795.00	7,950.00	585.45	5,854.50
		SAP #6000438								
		Approved Brands: Shain Solutions Model PT62PNB or other brands meeting bid specifications.								
		Brand Offered:					HANN (ALTERNATE)		DIVERSIFIED WOODCRAFTS	
		Model Offered:					A2-4260PL3-RC-MOD		PT-62PNB	
		Includes assembly and installation: State Yes or No					YES		YES	
		Delivery Days (ARO):					30 - 45		30 - 45	
		Warranty Period:					MFG STANDARD		LIMITED LIFETIME WARRANTY	
				10						
	2C		Each	10		No Bid	865.00	8,650.00	660.87	6,608.70
		SAP #6000439								
		Approved Brands: Shain Solutions Model PT- 7248PNB30 or other brands meeting bid specifications.								
		Brand Offered:					HANN (ALTERNATE)		DIVERSIFIED WOODCRAFTS	
		Model Offered:					A2-4872PL3-RC-MOD		PT-7248PNB30	
		Includes assembly and installation: State Yes or No					YES		YES	
		Delivery Days (ARO):					30 - 45		30 - 45	
		Warranty Period:					MFG STANDARD		LIMITED LIFETIME WARRANTY	
		TOTAL GROUP 2 (A - C Inclusive)						24,550.00	(A)	18,389.60
										•

III AM #					Blick Art Supp	lies	DGS Educational		School Specialty Inc.	
	Award Type	Description	U/M	Qty	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total
3 (Group	KILN, ELECTRIC				-				
- U			Each	40		No Bid		No Bid	2,479.88	99,195.20
		SAP #6000203								<u> </u>
		Size: 40"H (with stand) x 28.5"W, Wall Thickness: 2.5", 208 Volts, Single Phase, 48 amps. NEMA receptacle plug 6-50. Temperature (Max) 2250. Chamber: 27" Depth, 23 Opening, 7 cu.ft. Note: See Delivery requirements - Special Condition 6 and Installation - Special Condition 12.					GROUP DISQUA	LIFIED		
		Approved Brands: Skutt Model KM1027 or other brands meeting bid specifications.								
		Brand Offered:							SKUTT CERAMIC PRODUCTS	
		Model Offered:							KM-1027	
		Includes assembly and installation: State Yes or No							NO	
		Includes two (2) lid braces: State Yes or No							YES	
		Includes timer: State Yes or No							YES	
		Includes auto shut-off: State Yes or No							YES	
		Contains asbestos: State Yes or No							NO	
		Delivery Days (ARO):							30	
		Warranty Period:							2 YRS FROM PURCHASE DATE	
	3B	KILN FURNITURE SET (Includes the below)	Each/Se	41		No Bid	-	No Bid	376.28	15,427.4
		SAP #6000204								
		Full Kiln Shelves-10 sided (decagon) (2 EACH)								
		Approved Brands: Skutt Model 1027 or other brands meeting bid specifications.								
		Brand Offered:							SKUTT CERAMIC PRODUCTS	
		Model Offered:							0618 (ALTERNATE)	
		Delivery Days (ARO):							30	
		Half Kiln Shalvas Half decogon (0 FACH)								
		Half Kiln Shelves - Half decagon (8 EACH) Approved Brands: Skutt Model 1027 or other brands meeting bid specifications.								
		Brand Offered:							SKUTT CERAMIC PRODUCTS	
		Model Offered:							0618 (ALTERNATE)	
		1" Kiln Post - 1-1/2" Diameter (12 EACH)								
		Approved Brands: Skutt Model 1" or other brands meeting bid specifications.								
		Brand Offered:							SKUTT CERAMIC PRODUCTS	
		Model Offered:							0618 (ALTERNATE)	
		2" Kiln Post - 1-1/2" Diameter (12 EACH)								
						-				

				Blick Art Supp	olies	DGS Educational		School Specialty Inc.	
Item# Award	DESCRIPTION	U/M	Qty	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total
	Approved Brands: Skutt Model 2" or other brands meeting bid specifications.								
	Brand Offered:							SKUTT CERAMIC PRODUCTS	
	Model Offered:							0618 (ALTERNATE)	
	4" Kiln Post - 1-1/2" Diameter (12 EACH)								
	Approved Brands: Skutt Model 4" or other brands meeting bid specifications.					GROUP DIS	QUALIFIED		
	Brand Offered:							SKUTT CERAMIC PRODUCTS	
	Model Offered:							0618 (ALTERNATE)	
	6" Kiln Post - 1-1/2" Diameter (12 EACH)								
	Approved Brands: Skutt Model 6" or other brands meeting bid specifications.								
	Brand Offered:							SKUTT CERAMIC PRODUCTS	
	Model Offered:							0618 (ALTERNATE)	
	8" Kiln Post - 1-1/2" Diameter (12 EACH)								
	Approved Brands: Skutt Model 8" or other brands meeting bid specifications.								
	Brand Offered:							SKUTT CERAMIC PRODUCTS	
	Model Offered:							0618 (ALTERNATE)	
20		E 1/0 /	10		No Did		N. D.L	02.00	2.040.1
3C	,	Each/Se 4	ł8		No Bid		No Bid	82.09	3,940.3
	SAP #6000205								
	Basic Tool-All Wood- 7-1/2" long (1 EACH)								
	Approved Brands: Kemper Model BAS or other brands meeting bid specifications.							ALTERNATE:7 PIECE	
	Brand Offered:							SCHOOL SPECIALTY (ALTERNATE)	
	Model Offered:							408028 (ALTERNATE)	
	Delivery Days (ARO):							7-21	
	Wood Modeling Tool - 6" long (1 EACH)								
	Approved Brands: Kemper Model JA32 or other brands meeting bid specifications.							ALTERNATE: SET OF 10	
	Brand Offered:							SCHOOL SPECIALTY (ALTERNATE)	
	Model Offered:							407088 (ALTERNATE)	
	Wood Modeling Tool - 6" long (1 EACH)								
	Approved Brands: Kemper Model JA18 or other brands meeting bid								
	specifications.							ALTERNATE: SET OF 7	
	Brand Offered:							SAX (ALTERNATE)	
	Model Offered:							1440530 (ALTERNATE)	
	Double Wire End Tool -Approx. 6" long (1 EACH)								
	-								



				Blick Art Supplies	DGS Educational		School Specialty Inc.	
m# Awa	Description	U/M	Qty	Unit Price Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total
	Approved Brands: Kemper Model D2 or other brands meeting bid							
	specifications.						ALTERNATE: SET OF 7	
	Brand Offered:						SAX (ALTERNATE)	
	Model Offered:						1440530 (ALTERNATE)	
	Double Wire End Tool -Approx. 6" long (1 EACH)							
	Approved Brands: Kemper Model D6 or other brands meeting bid				GROUP DISQ	IIAIIEIED		
	specifications.				GROUP DISQ	UALIFIED	ALTERNATE: SET OF 7	
	Brand Offered:						SAX (ALTERNATE)	
	Model Offered:						1440530	
	Scraper, Steel (1 EACH)							
	Approved Brands: Kemper Model S3 or other brands meeting bid specifications.							
	Brand Offered:						SCHOOL SPECIALTY (ALTERNATE)	
	Model Offered:						457358	
	Wire Loop Sgraffito -6-1/4" long (1 EACH)							
	Approved Brands: Kemper Model WLS or other brands meeting bid							
	specifications.						SET OF 7 ASSORTED TOOLS	
	Brand Offered:						SCHOOL SPECIALTY (ALTERNATE)	
	Model Offered:						408028	
	Ribbon Tool - 6" long (1 EACH)							
	Approved Brands: Kemper Model R1 or other brands meeting bid						ALT CET OF F ACCORTED TOOLS	
	specifications. Brand Offered:						ALT: SET OF 5 ASSORTED TOOLS SCHOOL SPECIALTY (ALTERNATE)	
	Model Offered:						457370	
	wiodei Officied.						437370	
	Clay Sponge (1 EACH)							
	Elephant ear sponge 4" to 5" when moist.							
	Approved Brands: Kemper Model "Hydro Sponge" or other brands							
	meeting bid specifications.						ALT: SYNTHETIC SPONGE	
	Brand Offered:						SCHOOL SPECIALTY (ALTERNATE)	
	Model Offered:						408064	
	Clay Roller (1 EACH)							
	Minimum 2" dia., 9-3/4" barrel lengths, nylon bearings.							
	Approved Brands: Kemper Model FCR or other brands meeting bid specifications.							
	Brand Offered:						No Bid	
	Model Offered:							
	TOTAL GROUP 3 (A - C Inclusive)							Disqu



				Blick Art Suppl	ies	DGS Educational		School Specialty Inc.	
ltem#	Award Type	Description U/M	Qty	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total
4	Item	BIN, CLAY WITH WEDING BOARD Each	2		No Bid	920.00	1,840.00	457.91	915.82
		SAP #6000201						(A)	
		Heavy duty steel cabinet with removable plastic container and lid. Note: To be assembled and installed at school classroom location per Special Condition 12.							
		Approved Brands: Debcor Model 9420 or other brands meeting bid specifications. MODEL DISCONTINUED BY DEBCOR							
		Brand Offered:				MACO (ALTERNATE)		DEBCOR	
		Model Offered:				11713Y		9630	
		Includes plaster: State Yes or No				YES		NO	
		Includes assembly and installation: State Yes or No				YES		YES	
		Delivery Days (ARO):				30-45		30-45	
		Warranty Period:				MFG STANDARD		1 Year	
5	Item	CUTTER, MAT	-					F00.00	4.0/5.0
		SAP #6000060 Each	2	825.54	1,651.08	595.00	1,190.00	532.99	1,065.9
		Single pull-style cutting head both bevel and straight cutting heads. Must include a package of ten (10) Logan replacement blades #269 with order. Instruction manual or DVD must be provided with order.						(A)	
		Approved Brands: Logan Products Model 650-1 Elite plus blades or other brands meeting bid specifications.				LOGAN		LOGAN	
		Brand Offered:		Logan		650-1		650-1	
		Model Offered:		650-1 Elite		YES		YES	
		Includes replacement blades: State Yes or No		YES		30		7-21	
		Delivery Days (ARO):		28-Oct		MFG STANDARD		2 YRS AFTER PURCHASE DATE	
		Warranty Period:		1 Year					
6	Item	CUTTER, PAPER AND BOARD ROTARY Each	10		No Bid	425.00	4,250.00	62.40	624.0
		SAP #6000633						(A)	
		A precision cutter that will accurately cut 30 sheets of paper at a time. Minimum cutting length is 25 inches. Measurements are in inches and metric.							
		Approved Brands: Avery Myers Model 640N, Avery Model A2 Precision Cutter 640 mm, or other brands meeting bid specifications.							
		Brand Offered:				AVERY		SCHOOL SPECIALTY(ALTERNATE)	
		Model Offered:				A2-640MM		1466597	
		Delivery Days (ARO):				30		7-21	
		Warranty Period:				MFG STANDARD		1 YEAR	

					Blick Art Sup	plies	DGS Educational		School Specialty Inc.	
Item#	Award Type	Description	U/M	Qty	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total
7	Item	RACK, DRYING	Each	8	14,920.00	119,360.00	2,050.00	16,400.00	1,800.51	14,404.08
		SAP #6000440							(A)	
		Size: 26" x 36" – 1" spacing between shelves, 50 adjustable spring tension shelves which hold large paper and small 5" x 7" paper, large casters for easy portability, heavy duty all steel construction, powder-coated or enamel rust-resistant shelf finish. Note: To be assembled and installed at school classroom per Special Condition 12.								
		Approved Brands: AWT World Trade Model DR-36-50 or other brands meeting bid specifications.								
		Brand Offered:			AWT		AWT		AWT WORLD TRADE	
		Model Offered:			DR-36-50		DR-36-50		DR-36-50	
		Includes assembly and installation: State Yes or No			NO		YES		YES	
		Delivery Days (ARO):			90		30		30-45	
		Warranty Period:			1 YEAR		MFG STANDARD		1 YEAR	
0	Itom	WILEEL ELECTRIC DOTTER/S WITH STOOL & SPLASH DAN	Each	5		No Bid	1 755 00	0.775.00	1,536.18	7,680.90
8	nem		Each	J		NO DIG	1,755.00	8,775.00	·	7,000.70
		SAP #6000202							(A)	
		Heavy-duty wheel to have a 14" head, heavy steel table, one (1) HP, 10 amp motor and a six groove poly-V belt drive. Handles 300 lbs. of clay continuously. All steel construction, solid steel table. Must include six (6) bats per wheel.								
		Approved Brands: Amaco (Brent®) Model CXC or other brands meeting bid specifications.								
		Brand Offered:					AMACO (BRENT)		AMACO (BRENT) CXC	
		Model Offered:					СхС		22727 G	
		Includes stool, splash-pan and six (6) bats: State Yes or No					YES		NO	
		Delivery Days (ARO):					30		14 - 30	
		Warranty Period:					MFG STANDARD		10 YEARS	
9	Group	CABINETS								
	9A	CABINET, DAMP-PROOF	Each	2	2,326.00	4,652.00	2,190.00	4,380.00	2,316.92	4,633.84
	<i>,</i> ,,	SAP #6000492	_4011				۷,170.00	4,300.00		
		Size: 36"W x 19"D x 83"H. Made of 19 gauge welded steel with 16 gauge supports. Cabinet used to help keep clay "work-in-progress" in moist workable condition.								
		Approved Brands: Debcor Model 9100 or other brands meeting bid specifications.								
		Brand Offered:			DEBCOR		DEBCOR		DEBCOR	
		Model Offered:			9100		9100		9100	
		Delivery Days (ARO):			10-28		30		30-45	
		Warranty Period:			1 YEAR		MFG STANDARD		1 YEAR	
						-				
						-				



					Blick Art Supplies		DGS Educational		School Specialty Inc.	
Item#	Award Type	Description	U/M	Qty	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total
	9B	CABINET, DRYING	Each	4	1,786.00	7,144.00	1,775.00	7,100.00	1,793.60	7,174.40
		SAP #6001271								
		Size : 36"W x 19"D x 83"H. Constructed of 13 gauge angles welded to ¾"-1 gauge expanded steel mesh. Top and bottom pans are 16 gauge steel full welded and reinforced for extra heavy duty service.								
		Approved Brands: Debcor Model 9200 or other brands meeting bid specifications.								
		Brand Offered:			DEBCOR		DEBCOR		DEBCOR	
		Model Offered:			9200		9200		9200	
		Delivery Days (ARO):			10-28		30		30-45 DAYS	
		Warranty Period:			1 YEAR		MFG STANDARD		1 YEAR	
		TOTAL GROUP 9 (A - B Inclusive)				11,796.00	(A)	11,480.00		11,808.24
10	Group	CABINET, STORAGE								
	10A	CABINET, STORAGE – FLAMMABLE ONE SHELF	Each	2	970.00	1,940.00	1,325.00	2,650.00	690.72	1,381.44
		SAP #6001272								.,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,
		Size : 44"H x 43"W x 18"D. 2 Door, manual close with built in key lock three point latch-full length piano hinges. 30 Gallon Capacity. One adjustable she with tray or spill shelves.								
		Approved Brands: Justrite Manufacturing Model 893000, Eagle manufacturing Model 1932, or other brands meeting bid specification.								
		Brand Offered:			Basco Justrite		EAGLE		JUSTRITE MFG CO	
		Model Offered:			25300		1932		893000	
		Delivery Days (ARO):			10-28		30		30-45	
		Warranty Period:			1 YEAR		MFG STANDARD		1 YEAR	
	10D	CADINET CTODACE ELAMMADI E TIMO CUELVEC	Each	2	1,272.00	2,544.00	1,475.00	2,950.00	040.40	1 (0/ 04
	10B	CABINET, STORAGE – FLAMMABLE TWO SHELVES	Lacii		1,272.00	2,011.00	1,475.00	2,930.00	848.42	1,696.84
		SAP #6000493 Size: 65"H x 43"W x 18"D. 2 Door, manual close with built in key lock three point latch-full length piano hinges. 45 Gallon Capacity. Two (2) adjustable shelves with tray or spill shelves.								
		Approved Brands: Justrite Manufacturing Model 894500, Eagle Manufacturing Model 1947, or other brands meeting bid specifications.								
		Brand Offered:			Basco Justrite		EAGLE		JUSTRITE MFG CO	
		Model Offered:			25450		1947		894500	
		Delivery Days (ARO):			10-28		30		30-45	
		Warranty Period:			1 YEAR		MFG STANDARD		1 YEAR	
						4 404 00			/AN	2 070 20
		TOTAL GROUP 10 (A - B Inclusive)				4,484.00		5,600.00	(A)	3,078.28



ITB #	# :	19-054-1N	Tentative Board Meetin	g Date*: DI	ECEMBER 4, 2018	
ІТВ Т	Γitle:	ART EQUIPMENT	_ # Notified:	530	# Downloaded:	18
			# of Responses Rec'd:	1	# of "No Bids":	1
For:		VARIOUS SCHOOLS/DEPARTMENTS	ITB Opening Date :	NOVEMBE	R 9, 2018	
Fund:	:	(School/Department) VARIOUS FUNDS	Advertised Date:	OCTOBER 2	25, 2018	
Wareho adverse or inten protest of that "The days du Director protestin Broward SBBC I	busing Servicely affected by affected by ded decision or failure to the formal warring which or of Procurering an intended County, Folicy 3320,	TB RECOMMENDATION/TABULATION: ITB Reccess and www.Demandstar.com on NOVEMBER 14, 20 by the decision or intended decision shall file a notice of properties. The formal written protest shall be filed within ten (10) file a formal written protest shall constitute a waiver of protect protest shall state with particularity the facts and law the District is closed shall be excluded in the computation ment & Warehousing Services, 7720 West Oakland Park Beled decision shall post with the School Board, at the time of lorida, (SBBC), in an amount equal to one percent (1%) of Part VIII, Purchasing Policies, Section N, within the time	18 @ 3:00 pm and will remarctest, in writing, within 72 hd days after the date the notice roceedings under this chapter. We upon which the protest is barn of the 72-hour time period coulevard, Suite 323, Sunrise, left filing the formal written proof the estimated value of the days allowed for filing a bond share.	nin posted for ours after the p e of protest is Section 120.5 ased." Saturda provided. Filin Florida 33351. otest, a bond, p contract. Failu ll constitute a	72 hours. Any person osting of the notice of of filed. Failure to file a notice of control of the filed. Failure to file a notice of control of the filed. Failure to file a notice of the filed of the	who is decision otice of s, states ays and e of the n action doard of hired by otest.
		Silence, as stated in the ITB / RFP / RFQ / HARD Be is tentative. Confirm with the Purchasing Agent of				
SPECIF	FICATIONS	WARDED BY ITEM OR BY GROUP , TO THE LOWE , TERMS AND CONDITIONS.			SIDDER(S) MEETING	ALL
#	DESCRI	PTION	VENDOR(S) AV	VARDED		
3A.	KILN, EI	LECTRIC	SCHOOL SPECI	ALTY, INC.		
3B.	KILN FU	RNITURE SET	SCHOOL SPECI	ALTY, INC.		
3C.	CERAMI	C TOOL SET	SCHOOL SPECI	ALTY, INC.		
REJEC'	TED FOR P	NDED THAT FOR REASON(S) STATED ON THE A PARTICULAR ITEMS FOR NOT COMPLYING WITH I OD: DECEMBER 4, 2018 THROUGH SEPTEMBER 30,	TB REQUIREMENTS.	ON SHEET, T	ΓΗΕ BIDS REFEREN	CED BE
Ву:		Karlene Grant (Purchasing Agent)	Da	nte:	NOVEMBER 14, 2013	8

The School Board of Broward County, Florida, prohibits any policy or procedure which results in discrimination on the basis of age, color, disability, gender expression, national origin, marital status, race, religion, sex or sexual orientation. Individuals who wish to file a discrimination complaint, may call the Executive Director, Benefits & EEO Compliance at 754-321-2150 or Teletype Machine (TTY) at 754-321-2158.

Individuals with disabilities requesting accommodations under the Americans with Disabilities Act (ADA) may call the Equal Educational Opportunities (EEO) at 754-321-2150 or Teletype Machine (TTY) at 754-321-2158.

19-054N BID REJECTIONS

1. REJECT ITEM#1 FROM SCHOOL SPECIALTY, INC.

BID SUBMITTED FOR ITEM 1 WAS DISQUALIFIED FOR NOT MEETING ALL BID SPECIFICATIONS.

ITEM 1 - Line Items

- 1. It is the Bidder's responsibility to ensure products offered are in compliance with Section 6 Bid Specifications of the ITB.
- 2. For items in GROUPS, it is necessary to bid on every item in the group.
- 3. Incorrect specifications should be emailed to Purchasing Agent within the timeline stated in the ITB for questions.
- 4. For items with an incorrect/out dated model number, input price and note the correct model number.

				School S	pecialty, Inc.	
Item#	Award Type	Description	Unit of Measure	Quantity	Unit Price	Total Price
1A	Item	SINK UNIT-28" HIGH				DISQUALIFIED
		SAP #6001268				
		Hardwood cabinet 35" to 36" wide x 29" to 30" deep with double doors. Inside dimensions are 28" deep x 34" wide. Unit contains a double basin stainless steel sink 21" x 32" overall with water faucets and gooseneck nozzle (no spray hose). Sink has strainers and clay interceptor trap for easy clean out. 28" high gooseneck. (For elementary schools).				
1B	Item	SINK UNIT-36" HIGH				DISQUALIFIED
		SAP #6001269				
		Hardwood cabinet 35" to 36" wide x 29" to 30" deep with double doors. Inside dimensions are 28" deep x 34" wide. Unit contains a double basin stainless steel sink 21" x 32" overall with water faucets and gooseneck nozzle (no spray hose). Sink has strainers and clay interceptor trap for easy clean out. 36" high gooseneck. (For middle and high schools).				
				40		22.125.22
3A	Item	KILN, ELECTRIC - Size: 40"H SAP #6000203	Each	40	2,480	99,195.20
		Size: 40"H (with stand) x 28.5"W, Wall Thickness: 2.5", 208 Volts, Single Phase, 48 amps. NEMA receptacle plug 6-50. Temperature (Max) 2250. Chamber: 27" Depth, 23 Opening, 7 cu.ft. Note: See Delivery requirements - Special Condition 6 and Installation - Special Condition 12.				
		Approved Brands: Skutt Model KM1027 or other brands meeting bid specifications.				
		Brand Offered: Skutt				
		Model Offered: KM1027 - School Specialty item #220164				
		Includes assembly and installation: No -per Section 4, #6 Delivery of kilns of	nly			
		Includes two (2) lid braces: Yes				
		Includes timer: Yes				
		Includes auto shut-off: Yes				
		Contains asbestos: No				
		Delivery Days (ARO): 30 - 45				
		Warranty Period: 2 Years parts and labor				
3B	Item	KILN FURNITURE SET	Each/Set	41	376	15,427.48
		SAP #6000204				-,
		Approved Brands: Skutt Model 1027 or other brands meeting bid specifications.				
		Brand Offered: Skutt				

		Model Offered, 0/10 Cabael Charielty item #/22101				
		Model Offered: 0618 - School Specialty item #423191 Delivery Days (ARO): 30 - 45				
		Includes: (8) 5/8" Half Shelves - (6) each of 1" - 6" lenghths large post assortment.				
		assortment.				
3C	Item	CERAMIC TOOL SET	Each/Set	48	15	720.48
		SAP #6000205				
		Approved Brands: Kemper Model BAS or other brands meeting bid				
		specifications.				
		Brand Offered: Kemper				
		Model Offered: BAS - School Specialty item #408028				
		Delivery Days (ARO): 7 - 14				
		Includes: 1 each - Wire Loop Graffito Tool, Clean-up Tool, Lace Tool,				
		Cut-out Tool, Palette Knife, Sabre Saw, Salt and Pepper Drill				
6	Item	CUTTER, PAPER AND BOARD ROTARY				NO BID
		SAP #6000633				
		A precision cutter that will accurately cut 30 sheets of paper at a time.				
		Minimum cutting length is 25 inches. Measurements are in inches and				
		metric.				
		Approved Prender Avery Myere Model (40N) Avery Model A2 Precision				
		Approved Brands: Avery Myers Model 640N, Avery Model A2 Precision Cutter 640 mm, or other brands meeting bid specifications.				
		Cutter 640 mm, or other brailes meeting bid specifications.				
		Brand Offered:				
		Model Offered:				
		Delivery Days (ARO):				
		Warranty Period:				
		<u>.</u>				